
For June 14, 2015 

Smriti or to Remember 

Sweet child, whatever you want and for however many births you 
want, whether you want to come into the rosary of eight jewels 
or the rosary of one hundred and eight, BapDada has made an 
open offer to you.  

Become a master and claim your rights. There is no lock or key 
on any of the treasures. The key doesn’t require any effort. 
Simply have the one thought: Whatever I am, however I am, I 
belong to You. Overcome the games of Maya and come and sit 
next to Baba. 

Sweet Baba, during the course of the day I will reaffirm the 
awareness that “Whatever I am, however I am, I belong to you”. 
Should any negativity come, I will remember to go and sit with 
you in the Home of light. 

Samarthi or Power 

I constantly plug myself into the power that is received from the 
above smriti. I become aware how my smriti is recharging my 
self-respect. I pay attention to how my smriti is giving me 
strength and is allowing me to operate with equanimity and 
patience in an ever-changing world.  

Mano-vritti or Attitude 

Baba to Soul: Constantly keep a list of the present attainments in 
front of you and then the question: “When will this happen?” will 
change into: “It is happening now”. Instead of being disheartened, 
your hearts will become happy. 



I am determined have an attitude of joy as I think of my 
attainments in this Godly life. This attitude of joy comes when I 
let go of future worries and dwell in the blessings of the present. 

Drishti or Pure Vision 

Baba to Soul: When did the fashion of having a constantly ignited 
light start? At the confluence age, all of you became constantly 
ignited lights in the living form, and this memorial has therefore 
continued. So, what are all of you in your living forms? Constantly 
ignited lamps.  

In my drishti today, I focus on seeing others and myself as 
ignited lamps of God. Wherever we walk, we dispel the darkness 
and bring illumination. 

Creating a Wave 

I will do mansa seva and be part of creating a beautiful wave of 
pure remembrance and attitude spanning the whole globe during 
the 7:00pm to 7:30pm meditation. I will engage the smriti, mano-
vritti, and drishti from above and give sakaash to the whole world 
as a humble instrument. 


